Shelly Perkins

From: Shelly Perkins

Sent: Friday, December 21, 2018 12:31 PM

To: Ginger Pevonka

Subject: FW: Invoice 08-24-6912 from MorningStar Media Group, Ltd.
Attachments: Invoice_08246912_from_MorningStar_Media_Group_Ltd.pdf

They have a horrible accounting and billing system. One more.

From: MorningStar Media Group, Ltd. <quickbooks@notification.intuit.com>
Sent: Friday, December 21, 2018 12:16 PM

To: Shelly Perkins <sperkins@dekcohousing.com>

Subject: Invoice 08-24-6912 from MorningStar Media Group, Ltd.

MorningStar Media Group, Ltd.

Dear Housing Authority of the County of DeKalb,

Thank you for your business!
MorningStar Media Group, Ltd.

INVOICE 08-24-6912

DUE 11/05/2018

$500.00

Powered by QuickBooks

MorningStar Media Group, Ltd.
240 Edward St. Sycamore, IL 60178 US



